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一、依據『國立成功大學ㄧ貫修讀學、碩士學位辦法』，本學程為鼓勵本系優秀大學生繼續留在

本校修讀能源工程國際碩士學位學程，並期達到連續學習之效果及短修業年限，特訂定ㄧ貫

修讀學、碩士學位實施要點。 

Article1. 
To encourage bachelor’s degree students to continue their master’s degree studies at the International 
Master’s Degree Program on Energy Engineering (IMDPEE) with the goal of a continuous and shorter 
period of study, IBDPEE have established these regulations according to the regulations for Concurrent 
Bachelor’s and Master’s Degree Studies at NCKU. 
 
二、本學程大學部學生修畢應修畢業學分達二分之一以上，在學已達六學期以上（含），前五學

期之平均成績優秀者，得向系辦公室提出申請，並送學術委員會議審查。申請時間於每年5
月底前完成。通過名單將於六月底公告。 

Article 2 
Undergraduate students, who have taken more than 50 percent of graduate credits, completed six 
semesters of study with an excellent average score for the first five completed semesters, can apply for 
preliminary graduate program to the department office by the end of May. The academic committee 
members will examine the applications and announce the result by the end of June.  
 
三、申請應繳資料為大學部前五學期成績單（含班排名）及其他有利審查之資料(如推薦函、專題

論文或報告、課外活動經歷等…)。 

Article 3 
Required documents: Transcripts of the first five completed semesters (with class ranking) and other 
relevant information such as recommendation letters, independent study thesis, reports or records of 
extracurricular activities. 
 
四、審核通過錄取之學生兼具學士學位候選人及碩士班預備研究生（以下簡稱預研生）資格。 



Article 4 
Admitted students will become bachelor's degree candidates and preliminary graduate students.  
 
五、錄取之預研生名額至多為碩士班甄試錄取名額之二分之一為原則。每位教授每年至多指導二

位。經錄取之預研生應依循指導教授之指導，並接受規劃專業課程之選讀。 

Article 5  
The admission quota for preliminary graduate students should exceed no more than one-half of the total 
admission quota for master’s program through the Program Admission via Recommendation and 
Screening. 
Each professor can supervise no more than two preliminary graduate students each year. The 
preliminary graduate students should follow the guidance of their advisors, and take the professional 
courses suggested by them. 
 

六、錄取之預研生應於第八學期(含)前取得學士學位，並須參加其畢業年度之本學程碩士班甄試，

經錄取後始正式取得本學程碩士班研究生資格。 

Article 6 
The admitted preliminary graduate student must obtain bachelor’s degree before or by the eighth 
semester and have to attend the Program Admission via Recommendation and Screening in the 
graduation year. Once they are admitted by the Program Admission via Recommendation and Screening, 
they officially become master’s students at IMDPEE. 

 

七、預研生錄取本學程碩士班研究生者，於本校大學期間所選修之碩士班課程，其成績達七十分

以上者，可申請抵免三分之二（含）為限之應修學分數（不含論文學分），不受本校學生抵免學

分辦法有關研究所抵免學分上限規定之限制。但研究所課程若已計入大學部畢業學分內，不得再

申請抵免碩士班學分。學分抵免之申請程序應於開學三週內，向系辦公室申請之。 

Article 7 
Preliminary graduate students who have taken master’s courses during their undergraduate study period 
and whose scores are above 70 can apply for credit transfer to the maximum of two thirds of the 
required credits, excluding thesis credits. However, if the graduate courses have been counted as 
undergraduate graduate credits, the courses cannot be waived again in the master’s program. The 
applicants should submit the application to the department office within three weeks after semester 
begins. 
 
八、錄取之預研生正式取得本學程預研生資格後，應於開學後一個月內繳交指導教授同意書，以

一年畢業為原則。唯碩士學位之取得，仍應依教育部之規定，修滿碩士學分（含抵免學分數），



並完成論文撰寫與口試。 

Article 8 
Once the admitted preliminary graduate students have officially become graduate students, they should 
submit an advisor consent form to the department office one month after semester begins and in 
principle, finish the master’s program within one year. However, the acquirement of master’s degree 
should meet the regulations of Ministry of Education, which include taking required credits and 
completing thesis and oral defense. 
 

九、本要點經系務會議通過後實施，修正時亦同。  

Article 9 
This regulations should come into effect after being approved by the Department Affairs Meeting. Any 
amendments shall be processed accordingly. 


